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TIP SHEET
AUSTRALIA - 04th December 2019

R1 - ECHUCA | 12:30 | AUD $22,000 |  PERRICOOTA STATION (BM58)

3 REGAL ROSSA
Made a pleasing start to her career, scoring a debut win at Geelong. Has drawn well and sets the
standard here.

4 HAPPY STREET
Needs to bounce back after an underwhelming performance last start, if she can replicate the
form of a third place run at Benalla two back then she can stack up today. Rates strongly and
expected to finish much closer.

9 BIRD OF WAR
Progressive and lightly raced =lly. Last time recorded a 0.8 lengths win over 1135m at Geelong.
Has the ability and can run a forward race.

5 ROSE OF CAPRI
Won three times earlier on in her prep, most recently ran fourth by 0.8 lengths at Swan Hill over
1300m. Looks to improve.

10 ARMONA
Fitter for recent racing and looks close to a win after =nishing second over 1000m at Wangaratta
last time. Ticking along nicely so don't underestimate.

R2 - GOSFORD | 12:45 | AUD $35,000 |  CENTRAL COAST LEAGUES CLUB MDN

5 HYANNIS PORT
Nicely bred =lly by sire Redoute's Choice from the stakes winning mare Mrs Onassis. Scored at
recent trial and expected to run well.

6 LILLEMOR
Dual acceptor. Hallowed Crown =lly from the stakes winning mare Polar Success who was a
Group 1 winner on the track. Last trial won barrier trial over 1045m at Randwick on Nov 12. From
a leading yard and profiles well for this.

2 ROME
Returns here having had just one run last campaign, =nishing =fth over 1100m at Hawkesbury
before a four months break. Rates well with a solid winning fresh record and looks well placed
here fresh.

3 AEECEE DYNASTY
Trialled before racing and then overcame diAculties in running to make a solid debut at Orange.
Expect improvement from that effort. Changes jockey today. Will be in the =nish in this small
field.

1 PIVOT
Rubick gelding who was a AUD $ 100,000 (Magic Millions 2018 Gold Coast Yearling Sale)
yearling. In the placings at most recent trial and is capable of a fair run.

R3 - ECHUCA | 13:05 | AUD $22,000 |  MURPHY'S TURF & L'SCAPING-BM58

1 OUR HOT DATE
Narrowly beaten when running third at Seymour last start only beaten 0.9 lengths. Improver. A
win is on the cards.

2 SWISS HERO
Should be ready to improve after two runs back, the latest when fourth over 1400m at Terang.
Fitter again and expected to prove hard to beat.

4 SHE WON'T LEAVE
Broke through three back but disappointing in two runs since, the latest when =fth over 1600m at
Swan Hill. Rates well here and don't overlook.

3 BILLY BOB
Finished mid=eld but beaten only 1.7 lengths when ninth over 1300m at Swan Hill. Racing well
and rates among the top chances.

9 PETTICOAT PRINCESS
Struggling to =nd best form, needs to improve on last start when sixth over 1406m at Benalla.
Overdue but will need to improve.

R4 - GOSFORD | 13:20 | AUD $35,000 |  BISHOP COLLINS HCP (C2)

2 BIG PARADE
Resuming from a spell in this. Only career win came in country grade when winning as a two-
year-old. He has ability and with the drop in grade features as a top chance.

1 BLAZING
Resuming today after a successful =rst campaign scoring two from =ve starts. Rates highly
today.

4 NUKE
Resumes here after four months break. In readiness for this trialled on November 14 Should be
fitter for the trial and has won first up before. Capable of big run.

6 MISS VALBONNE
Lightly raced =lly progressing well. Last start posted a one length win over 1100m at this track.
Rates well and is worth including in the multiples.

3 UNDOUBTED
Ran on strongly and found a maiden win at this track last time out. This is harder but has
potential to improve. Place best.
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R5 - ECHUCA | 13:40 | AUD $22,000 |  BET365 ODDS PROTECTOR (BM58)

1 BEING DAZZLED
Finished win last start over 1000m at Cranbourne. Rarely wins, with just 4 successes from 41
starts. Has the ability and can run a forward race.

2 BALLE D'OR Freshened for this and a return to best can go close.

5 BILLABONG BILBY
Honest mare who has a good career place strike. Ran second at Gundagai over 1000m last start.
Inform jockey rides and will be hard to hold out.

3 VAHVUUS
Progressive and lightly raced mare. Last time recorded a 6 length win over 1000m at Dunkeld.
Rates highly in this and expected to be in the finish.

4 TASMAN'S REWARD
First up in this following seven months break. Resumes here following a 850m barrier trial at
Tatura on November 12. Is a first up winner. Apprentice rides with 3kg claim.

R6 - GOSFORD | 13:55 | AUD $35,000 |  JOHN SINGLETON GROUP (BM70)

2 MONSIEUR MACRON
Almost found the win last start running a close 0.6 lengths third at Gold Coast over 1300m.
Improver. A win is on the cards.

1 ALLZIN
Yet to break through this campaign but hasn't been far away including a last start third over
1600m at Newcastle. Form good for this and is expected to run well.

6 HAMMOON BALLAD
Yet to recapture best form after two runs from a break, the latest =nishing ninth over 1300m at
Newcastle. Further improved and should run well.

7 DANCING RACHEL
Shooting for a hat-trick of wins after making it two on end with a head win over 1600m at this
track. Going well and is among the winning hopes.

3 SURJIN
Yet to recapture best form after two runs from a break, the latest =nishing eighth over 1600m at
this track. Rates well and is among the chances.

R7 - BEAUDESERT | 14:12 | AUD $21,000 |  SPELL & PRE-TRAIN AT AQUIS-C5

1 SPIRIT'S PRIDE
Handy entire who broke through for a win over 1640m at Toowoomba was well in the market.
Harder here but rates highly.

2 SPANISH HURRICANE Has been racing on the pace at his two starts in. Ready to improve now. Rates highly.

5 RESET'S SON
Returned to the winners circle after a long while last time out at this track scoring by 1.5 lengths.
Impressed last start and go on with it.

6 SKY ONE
Likes the distance and goes well with multiple placings. Not far away last time. Worth thought
here.

4 EIRA Followed up a second at Gatton with a win last start. Drawn well in barrier two here. Right in this.

R8 - GOSFORD | 14:30 | AUD $35,000 |  BATEAU BAY HOTEL (BM64)

3 EDISON
Resumes here after a two months spell and a 735m Randwick barrier trial where he won a barrier
trial. Form last campaign was excellent and expect a forward showing here. Leading contender
first up.

1 ISORICH
Followed up a second at Wyong with a win last start. Capable of going on with it here and has
drawn well in barrier four. Right in this.

6 ZETA'S ROCKET
Broke through for a win last start after running a close second at Wyong. Looks well suited in this
field.

7 LIBERTY SUN
Ran middle of the pack last start at this track when =rst up and rates highly with Aaron Bullock
aboard. Has the ability to be in the finish.

9 LAGARDE
Should be ready to improve after two runs back, the latest when second over 1000m at this track.
Further improved and don’t discount altogether.
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R9 - BEAUDESERT | 14:47 | AUD $21,000 |  AQUIS SELLING @ MAGIC MIL-BM70

4 RAMTASTIC
Dual acceptor. Four-year-old fresh from a spell. Yet to miss a minor placing in two resuming runs.
Trialled prior to this and looks set for another bold first-up showing.

1 HIGH COST
Veteran sprinter racked up another win last start to make a total of 9 career wins, last start was
win over 1110m at Doomben. Easier here and rates well this company.

6 ANNATIME
Broke through for a win last start after running a close third at Gold Coast. Looks well placed
here, definitely in the mix.

8 OUR ROCKY
Course and distance winner who is overdue for a win, the latest when =fth but beaten only 5
lengths over 1255m at Ballina. Thereabouts last time and can sneak into the =nish with the right
run.

3 MISHANI PHOENIX
Veteran sprinter who has 7 wins to his name, last time was a 18 length =fth over 1640m at
Toowoomba. Rates well on best form and is worth including in the multiples.

R10 - BEAUDESERT | 15:22 | AUD $30,000 |  TAB HCP

1 CABALO ESCURO
Solid in both runs at the start of this preparation and then relished getting out to 1200m last
start when winning by a big space. Fitter again so expect further improvement.

6 SAY HAYA
Progressive and lightly raced =lly. Last time recorded a 3 length sixth over 1000m at Sunshine
Coast. Rates highly in this and expected to be in the finish.

7 IN GREAT NIC
Drops in trip since latest effort at Gold Coast when second, =nishing 4 lengths off the winner.
Gets a good jump from an inside barrier here and is worth some thought here.

4 EFFORT
Showed some ability when =rst on debut. He was disappointing in follow up run when sixth at
Sunshine Coast last start. Looks a capable type and can improve here.

11 VOGUE
Improved sharply at second run from a spell, running on strongly to =nish a head second over
1100 at Gold Coast. Fitter again and rates among the chances.


