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TIP SHEET
UNITED KINGDOM - 06th February 2020

R14 - CHELMSFORD | 21:10 | GBP £5,688 |  TOTEPLACEPOT FIRST BET OF THE DAY CLASSIFIED STAKES

1 LADY OF YORK
Returned to the winners circle after a long while last time out at this track scoring by 1.75
lengths. Impressed last start and go on with it.

5 KERRERA
Poor winning strike rate overall with just two wins from 20 starts, latest was third over 2000m at
this track. Rates highly on best form and expected to measure up.

4 JOHNI BOXIT
Is coming back signi>cantly in trip after running 2670m last time out at this track where he ran
sixth by 11 lengths. Can run for a place.

2 CASH N CARRIE
Latest ran in second over 2000m at this track, rarely winning with just one success from 17
starts. Has the ability and looks one of the major players.

7 N OVER J
Latest ran in fourth over 2450m at Wolverhampton, rarely winning with just one success from 28
starts. Rates well and is worth including.

R15 - CHELMSFORD | 21:40 | GBP £5,688 |  MAY BANK HOLIDAY FAMILY FUN DAY HANDICAP

2 CALIDUS MIRABILIS
Won narrowly by a long neck last time out at Dundalk All Weather but will have to carry more
weight. Expected to be in the finish.

1 VERTICE
Among the placegetters when third over 1900m at Wolverhampton carrying 51.5kg. Up in weight
here but bold showing expected again.

7 ARABESCATO
Strong effort last start to win by 1.5 lengths at Ling>eld All Weather, rising in class today. In this
mix in this tougher field.

12 DARK SIDE DIVISION
Didn't inspire last start beaten 21.15L at Ling>eld All Weather. Ratings suggest a better run than
last.

3 HANDSOME YANK
Finished in the placings last time carrying 56kg over 1740m at Wolverhampton. Up in weight but
is worth including again.

R16 - CHELMSFORD | 22:10 | GBP £5,688 |  GOOD FRIDAY EASTER FAIR HANDICAP

7 CHANNEL PACKET
Finished third two starts back before a good win at Newcastle All Weather last start. Racing in
fine fettle at present and likely to get a good run, looks well placed.

8 TANQEEB
Improved sharply last time to break through for maiden win over 1440m at Wolverhampton.
Inside draw will assist and expected to be in the finish.

9 VELVET VISION
Scored after a long drought last time at Southwell All Weather by a long neck over 1600m.
Impressed last start and go on with it.

2 MADEEH
Missed the placings last time over a longer journey when fourth over 2500m at Newcastle All
Weather. Can make a bold showing and is worth thought.

3 LUNAR DEITY
Among the placegetters when second over 1600m at this track carrying 54.5kg. More weight here
but is among the each way hopes.

R17 - CHELMSFORD | 22:40 | GBP £13,000 |  NEW TOTE HANDICAP

2 MOHAREB
Lightly raced gelding progressing well. Last start posted a neck third over 1400m at Ling>eld All
Weather. Rates highly in this and expected to be in the finish.

4 FIZZY FEET
Powered home to win with style by 1.25 lengths at Ling>eld All Weather last start, rises in class
this start. Rates well despite tougher race.

7 PRINCE OF ROME
Fairly consistent but had a poor run latest when a 9.75 lengths sixth over 1200m at Kempton
Park All Weather. Rarely far away and don’t underestimate.

6 STORM OVER
Sat on the speed last run at this track and fought on well to win. He has a fantastic record at this
venue and is a strong chance to figure again.

9 COMMANDER HAN
Rarely far away but >nds it hard to win with just the one career success. Last start was fourth
over 1000m at Newcastle All Weather on January 17. Doesn’t win often but can sneak into the
finish.


