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TIP SHEET
UNITED KINGDOM - 10th October 2019

R1 - GUNNEDAH | 12:40 | AUD $22,000 |  KELAHER INSTRUMENT/ELECT. (C2)

2 HEREDERO
Drops in journey since latest outing at Scone when third, 4nishing 2 lengths off the winner.
Leading contender.

1 DERBY STAR
Well deserved win last start after a close 4fth two starts back. Capable of going on with it here
and has drawn well in barrier one. Expect bold showing.

3 MASTER CRAMSIE
Stepping out to this circuit for the 4rst time but rates well at this journey. 3kg apprentice claim
helps.

8 BLINKIN FANTASTIC
Progressive and lightly raced mare. Last time recorded a 3.25 lengths third over 1200m at
Tamworth. Has the ability and is a definite each way hope.

7 ANNIE'S STREET
Finished off last campaign with a 5 length 4fth over 1400m at Pakenham Park Synthetic. Rates
strongly and is worth including in the multiples.

R2 - WYONG | 12:55 | AUD $35,000 |  AUSSIE DUCT-IPD-SAL-PSA MDN

1 AKARI
Took plenty from 4rst up run when second beaten only 0.8 lengths last start over 1100m at this
track. Winning chance.

13 INVINCIBLE KISS
Fair effort when second at Gosford last start when well in the market. Has to have place claims if
she can reproduce that form again. This no harder and rates well.

5 DUENNA
Finish close to the winner in both starts this campaign. Ready to improve now. Must be
respected.

3 THREEOOD Still chasing her elusive first win after twelve career starts. Could run into a place again today.

8 SNIPERESS
Among the placings in her latest trial and bold showing expected. Pro4les well and worth
keeping safe.

R3 - GUNNEDAH | 13:15 | AUD $22,000 |  KELAHER INSTRUMENT/ELECT. CUP

1 ATHENA'S VOICE
Missed the placings last time over a longer trip when eighth over 2300m at Newcastle. Rates well
and gets chance to break through.

10 YANKEE TANGO
Well rated galloper. Ran a close second last start at this track when beaten a head after starting
at $2.90. Major player.

7 OUTTA SPACE
Out of the placings last time when 4fth over a longer 2200m journey at Dubbo. Rates fairly and is
among the chances.

6 RAGE AGAINST
Hasn't hit the frame in recent outings although looked better when fourth at this track last time.
3kg apprentice claim helps.

3 ZAGAYA
Made a return to form with a second place 4nish over 1788m at Dalby when well supported.
Progressing well this campaign. Gets to right race now.

R4 - WYONG | 13:35 | AUD $35,000 |  LEGRAND AUST HCP (C2)

2 CITY OF LOVE
Finished mid4eld but beaten only 0.9 lengths when 4fth over 1400m at Scone. Rates highly here
and should run well.

3 BRIGID OF KILDARE
Nicely rated mare. Scored a close win last start at Nowra on a soft track winning by a head
starting at $3.30. Can go close here.

5 AESOP'S FABLE
And looking for a hat-trick. This is a tougher race here but she has been winning with something
in hand. Can't knock that winning form.

7 CLASSY FELLA
Poor winning strike rate overall with just one win from 11 starts, latest was 4fth over 1500m at
Rosehill. Rates well and is worth including in the multiples.

4 COURU
Found herself positioned up on the speed at Scone last start and worked home nicely, running
second. Not beaten far on that occasion. Looks capable of fighting out the finish again here.
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R5 - GUNNEDAH | 13:50 | AUD $22,000 |  KELAHER INSTRUMENT/ELECT.-BM66

4 CHARLIE'S LAW Well held last time. Worked early there. Given a short break and can bounce back now.

1 MYSTICISM
Continues to race well, the latest 4nishing 6.5 lengths fourth over 1600m at Moree. Will be
winding up strongly.

3 BLINKIN FAST
Faded on fresh run when tenth at Scone. Amongst the chances today. Not great 4rst up run
when tenth at Scone but chance on best form.

5 WILLYAMA
Returned to winning form last time when scoring by half a length over 1410m at Wellington. Has
confidence back and bold showing expected.

2 NEW ENDEAVOUR
Almost found the win last start running a close a nose second at this track over 1600m. In the
mix coming into this start.

R6 - WYONG | 14:10 | AUD $35,000 |  OMEGA-TRADER-MATCHMASTER-BM64

1 GREAT DANGER
Lightly raced gelding progressing well. Last start posted a 1.2 lengths third over 1600m at Eagle
Farm. Has the ability and expected to run well.

4 MO THE GREAT
Fitter for two runs from a spell and wasn’t far away when sixth over 1400m at Newcastle. Making
headway and should be right in the mix.

3 ISORICH
Well held last start at Canterbury and never looked like troubling the top few. Can expect a better
run this time out.

2 CHIEF IN COMMAND
Only just missed when third two runs back at Canterbury before 4nishing fourth at Lismore last
start. Rises in distance for this and must come into consideration.

11 ARROGANT LASS
Lightly raced mare progressing well. Last start posted a 4.25 lengths eighth over 1300m at
Goulburn. Rates well and is among the chances.

R7 - GUNNEDAH | 14:25 | AUD $22,000 |  KELAHER INSTRUMENT/ELECT.-BM58

8 TALDORA MISS
Progressive and lightly raced mare. Last time recorded a 0.8 lengths win over 900m at
Newcastle. Rates highly in this and expected to go close.

2 THE MONT
Fitter and does have a solid second up record. Resumed with a 3.5 lengths 4fth over 950m at
Moree. Rates strongly and expected to be further improved.

7 SNIPEX ABAA
Running well recently including a last start second by 2.5 lengths over 950m at Moree.
Thereabouts lately and rates among the leading hopes.

13 MS WICKED NICCI
Was prominent throughout at Tamworth, working to the line in good fashion to run second.
Wasn't beaten by far in that affair. Looks capable of fighting out the finish again here.

3 JUSTIFY
Broke through three back but disappointing in two runs since, the latest when tenth over 1050m
at Doomben. Could find frame on this start and in the mix here.

R8 - WYONG | 14:45 | AUD $35,000 |  REPELEC-LEVEY AGENCIES HCP-C2

12 YITAI SYNERGY
Made all and came away with a win at this track over 900m in June. Proven to be race 4t now.
Expect another forward showing today.

3 KOSCIUSKO
Won two of 4ve career runs to date, the latest 4nishing fourth over 900m at Newcastle. Rates
highly and expected to go close.

9 INTERRAM Resumes today after scoring her maiden win two back in her debut campaign. Can contest.

4 BENTLEY MAGIC
Has been thereabouts without winning, the latest 4nishing second over 1100m at Canterbury.
Rates well and is worth including in the multiples.

10 MADAM OAKS Racing in good form making it two wins in a row at Canberra over 1200m. In the mix here.


