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PERTH - 11th August 2020

R1 - ROCKHAMPTON | 12:57 | AUD $17,000 |  TAB PLATE (C3)

22 OKIE
Doesn't win out of turn but has found two wins and eight minors from fourteen starts. Could 3nd
a win looking well suited.

44 SVINDAL
Missed the placings last time over a longer journey when sixth over 1560m at Mackay. Can
improve on last start and expected to be in the finish.

66 RED SATIN
Missed the placings last time over a longer trip when sixth over 1500m at this track. Rates well
and expected to go close.

55 DON'T DOUBT MAEVE
Went down by a head to 3nish second at Mackay over 1300m in most recent effort. Main
contender.

11 DOOM
Has been a long time since a win but not far away, the latest when half a length second at this
track. Thereabouts and is a definite each way hope.

R2 - ROCKHAMPTON | 13:34 | AUD $17,000 |  ROCKHAMPTON BUS. MACHINES HCP

1010 TARAKI
Five-year-old mare who drops in distance since latest effort at Mackay when second, 3nishing 0.8
lengths off the winner. Looks a strong contender.

22 BOGEY MAN
Was underwhelming last start but if he can replicate the form of his third place run Mackay two
back he could give hope to this run. Will be charging home late and hard to hold out.

44 ALL EEZ
Just missed out on the placings last start when 3fth at this track. Appreciates racing at this track
having recorded four wins and four minor placings from ten starts. Rates highly.

33 THE BAKER
Seven-year-old gelding who was a head winner over 1300m at Emerald last time. Going well and
on strong record at this distance rates a leading playing again.

66 TEN TAUBADA'S
Handy gelding racing in good form, 3nished mid3eld last time when second but beaten only one
length over 1380m. Rates well and don’t underestimate.

R3 - ROCKHAMPTON | 14:12 | AUD $17,000 |  MILNE BROS HCP (58)

66 LINGALONGA LASS Dual acceptor.

11 KING KLAUS Well deserved win last start after a close third two starts back. Looks well suited in this field.

22 MONSTROSITY
Returns from a four months spell after 3nishing tenth over 1175m at Albury before a break.
Shapes nicely and among the better hopes.

1212 MARRON CHEVAL
Made a strong run to 3nish sixth over 1050m at Mackay and will relish the extra ground here.
Ready to peak after four runs back and sure to go close if runs up to best.

1010 ANGOLA MISS
Has been thereabouts at last two runs before going for a spell, the last 3nishing fourth over
1812m at Port Macquarie. Has the ability and don’t discount altogether.

R4 - ROCKHAMPTON | 14:50 | AUD $17,000 |  BELROMA PARK HCP (58)

22 APPLICANT
Returned from a spell with a 2.5 lengths win over 1050m at this track. Has a low draw here and
should run well.

88 OYASHIO
Broke through at Mackay for his maiden win over 1100m last start and coming into a harder field
this start. Gets the chance to win again.

99 ARQUERA
Improved twice over to place second at Gatton last time out over 1100m. Looks well placed and
rates highly off that run. Expected in the finish.

33 NOT LIABLE
Missed the placings last time over a longer trip when 3fth over 1200m at Mackay. Rates well and
looks hard to beat.

1313 SUZI BEL
Resumed over 1200m and missed the placings when a 5 length eighth at this track. Rates highly
and looks a strong winning hope on best form. Fitter for the run and expected to be in the 3nish
this time.


