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TIP SHEET
PERTH - 12th August 2020

R1 - BELMONT PARK | 13:14 | AUD $20,000 |  WESTERN RACEPIX MDN

1 DON'T ARGUE BUSTER Finished a close second at this track over 1200m in latest outing. Improver. Top Hope.

8 WARDIAN Just pipped a head at Pinjarra over 1200m as favourite in most recent effort. Will take catching.

3 TRADED CROWN
Yet to place in two career runs but shows promise, including a last start 2.5 lengths =fth over
1200m at this track. Rates highly here and expected to measure up.

7 STROUD
Gelding by Denman who makes debut and was a $14000 yearling. Last trial was runner-up at
Belmont Park barrier trial over 1000m July 20. Rates strongly and should run well.

2 BARNSLEY BOY
Recently racing outside the placings, latest was fourth beaten by 2.75 lengths over 1200m at
Pinjarra. Thereabouts latest. Could sneak a place.

R2 - BELMONT PARK | 13:49 | AUD $20,000 |  FREE ENTRY TO BELMONT PARK MDN

2 BRAZEN ARROW
Returns from a four months spell after =nishing sixth over 1200m at Pinjarra before a break.
Shapes nicely and expected to measure up.

6 NATURAL AIRCHIEF
Excellent trial performance. Well fancied in this line up. Making debut and rates an excellent
winning chance.

1 GUARDED
Ran a fair result two back at this course and distance, running sixth by 2.75 lengths. Can run
better today.

4 ENTICING
Son of Headwater from the mare Draw The Curtain and was a $37000 yearling. Last trial was
runner-up at Belmont Park barrier trial over 1000m July 20. From strong yard and rates well for
this.

8 ZADOK Resumes after six months off. Debut run wasn't inspiring. Expected to bounce back.

R3 - BELMONT PARK | 14:24 | AUD $25,000 |  AMELIA PARK HCP (C1)

5 DIVINE QUEST
Kept coming last time over 1400m at Northam to =nish 14th and will appreciate the extra
ground here. Looks well placed here and capable of going close.

2 BURN ONE DOWN
Form since resuming has been disappointing, last start ran in seventh over 1400m at Northam.
Well suited here and can take this.

6 DOLUSKY
Fitter for two runs from a let up, the latest when seventh over 2200m at this track, but hasn’t won
for four years. Below par latest but can do much better.

8 SEA SPRING
Doesn't win often and last win was three years ago. Latest when a 5.5 lengths seventh over
1200m at Pinjarra. Has the ability and can break through on best form.

4 SMART FASCINATOR
Missed the placings last time over a longer journey when eighth over 2200m at this track. Can
make a bold showing and can sneak into the finish with the right run.

R4 - BELMONT PARK | 15:02 | AUD $25,000 |  ASCEND SALES TROPHIES HCP (C1)

5 EMPIRE REIGN
Broke maiden status at latest outing when winning at this track over 1300m, and faces a rise in
class this start. Looking well suited this start.

4 SATURDAY SUN
Consistent gelding who has placed almost half of his career runs. Narrowly defeated when
second at this track over 1200m last start. Rates highly.

1 COMFORT ME
Consistent galloper =tter for two runs from a spell, the latest when 3.25 lengths third over 1000m
at this track. Rates well here and expected to be much improved

2 DOUBLE SPICE
Won =rst up two back at this track but couldn't go on with it at Northam last time out. Has place
claims.

3 LUCKY HEART
Couldn't replicate form second up after winning two back at Pinjarra over 1200m. Can improve
from last start here.
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R5 - BELMONT PARK | 15:37 | AUD $25,000 |  FURPHY HCP (C3)

1 EXCELLENT DREAM
Won three of seven career runs to date, the latest =nishing =rst over 1000m at this track. Rates
highly and expected to be in the finish.

4 AMELIA BEDELIA
Lightly raced mare progressing well. Last start posted a 3.75 lengths sixth over 1200m at this
track. Rates highly in this and expected to go close.

7 CLASSY LASSY
Mare who usually sets the tempo in her races. Beaten by just a neck when second at this track in
latest effort. Likely improver. A win is on the cards.

5 STELLA DOOR
Lightly raced gelding progressing well. Last start posted a 5.25 lengths sixth over 1200m at this
track. Rates highly in this and expected to be in the finish.

2 VELAGO
Resumes here after a nine months spell and a 950m Lark Hill barrier trial where he placed in a
barrier trial. Form last campaign was excellent and a forward showing is to be expected.

R6 - BELMONT PARK | 16:15 | AUD $30,000 |  MUMM CHAMPAGNE (RS0LY)

3 CONQUERED ZONE
Lightly raced gelding progressing well. Last start posted a 3 length seventh over 1600m at
Northam. Has the ability and looks one of the major players.

7 BURNING MAGIC
Won two times earlier on in her prep, most recently placed second by 1.3 lengths at Northam
over 1600m. Looks to improve.

1 STORMY RULER
Below par in two runs since a win three back, the latest =nishing =fth over 1600m at Northam.
Hoping to find winning form again here and holds a chance.

8 TONKATUFF
Good effort when fourth at this track over 1200m last start. Has claims in this race if he can
reproduce that form today. Worthy of consideration.

12 ARAGAIN
Tackles city class this time after winning in easier over 1600m at Pinjarra. Has further upside
and is worth including for a value bet.

R7 - BELMONT PARK | 16:55 | AUD $25,000 |  TABTOUCH BETTER YOUR BET (C3)

11 SENTIMENTAL QUEEN
Landed maiden success last time, scoring by 1.8 lengths over 1400m at Northam. Rates well
despite stronger field and expected to measure up again.

3 BRUTUS MAXIMUS
Broke maiden two back and not far away since, the latest when a 2 length second over 1300m at
this track. Continues to make headway. Top chance.

4 STEVIE'S WONDER
First run back from a spell was at this track when runner up over 1400m on July 29. Winning
chance.

6 COMBAT READY
Seven-year-old gelding who won last time at this distance, winning by 0.8 lengths at Northam.
Rates highly and on top record at this trip can run a forward race.

1 GREAT HEIST
Made a strong run to =nish =fth over 1200m at this track and will relish the extra ground here.
Should be at top now and can do much better this time.


