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TIP SHEET
AUSTRALIA - 12th September 2019

R1 - HAWKESBURY | 12:45 | AUD $35,000 |  THE BACHMAYER ORTHODONTIC MDN

7 WILD SHEILA
Was positioned right up near the speed last start working home well for a third at Newcastle. Not
beaten far on that occasion. Comes into calculations here after latest effort.

10 TISANE
Beaten by a half a length when second at Newcastle on 1895m in latest effort. Looks close to a
win here.

3 ZOMBIE
Raced well on debut, but then failed to go on with the job the following start when ;fth at Kembla
Grange over 1600m. Looks a capable type and can improve here.

8 WAR BARON
Well held last start at Randwick-Kensington and never looked like troubling the top few. Ratings
suggest a better run than last.

2 FIRST FOOTMAN
Finished mid;eld but beaten only 2 lengths when fourth over 1500m at Newcastle. Racing well
and can sneak into the finish.

R2 - ROCKHAMPTON | 13:05 | AUD $17,000 |  TONY MADDEN ARCHITECTS (BM55)

4 ATTIQUE
Had a winning run broken last time out when second at this track though wasn't far away and
can be forgiven for that effort. Looks like she'll take some beating.

1 ABSOLUT ARTIE
Led from start to ;nish last start and came away with a win at this track over 1500m on August
23. Proven to be race fit now. Expect another forward showing today.

2 BLUE SEAL
Won two times earlier on in his prep, most recently ran fourth by 3.5 lengths at Pakenham Park
Synthetic over 1600m. Rates for a place.

7 FINUCANE MISSILE
Poor winning strike rate overall with just one win from 13 starts, latest was ;fth over 1500m at
this track. Has the ability and should measure up.

3 FLAT TO STACK
Yet to break through this campaign but hasn't been far away including a last start third over
1600m at this track. Going well and is a must for the multiples.

R3 - HAWKESBURY | 13:20 | AUD $35,000 |  RICHMOND CLUB (BM64)

6 STELLAR IMPACT
Found maiden win last start as favourite at Newcastle. Rates well and can continue winning
form. Looks a winning chance.

2 POULTON LE SANDS
Progressive and lightly raced gelding. Last time recorded a 1.3 lengths win over 1600m at
Tamworth. Has the ability and expected to run well.

3 HEMSTED
Running well recently including a last start second by 1.5 lengths over 1800m at this track. Has
the ability and can run a forward race.

1 GREAT GLEN
Fairly consistent galloper who ran well below best latest when a 23 length seventh over 1600m
at Randwick. Has the ability and looks one of the chances.

5 RESORT
Started this campaign with poor form, last start recording ;fth by 3.5 lengths over 2010m at
Moruya. Has the ability and can break through on best form.

R4 - ROCKHAMPTON | 13:40 | AUD $17,000 |  GARRARD'S HORSE AND HOUND (C6)

5 CRAFTY COP
Disappointed last time when well beaten to ;nish 13th beaten by 8.25 lengths over 1200m at
Gold Coast. Capable of much better and may be worth another try.

4 TAPA
Led all the way last start and came away with a win at this track over 1050m on August 23.
Proven to be race fit now. Expect another forward showing today.

6 THE REAL BOSS
Honest record overall and ;tter for one run from a spell when 11th over 900m at Gold Coast. Has
the ability and is a definite each way hope.

2 MALKARA
Should be ready to improve after two runs back, the latest when ;fth over 1050m at this track.
Further improved and don’t discount altogether.

7 METEOR'S MAN
Finished second last start over 950m at Bluff. Rarely wins, with just 3 successes from 49 starts.
Has the ability but needs to find best.
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R5 - HAWKESBURY | 13:55 | AUD $35,000 |  BEDROCK QUARRY PRODUCTS HCP-C2

7 LAILA DE VEGA Beaten by a neck when second at this track on 1400m in latest effort. Looks close to a win here.

1 GOLDEN HITS
Gelding who likes to lead. Was nearly the winner when ;nishing a neck second at Kembla Grange
last start. Likely improver. A win is on the cards.

2 TOROSO
Fairly honest gelding but does ;nd it hard to win. Course and distance winner, the latest when
fifth over 1600m at Wyong. Has the ability and is worth including in the multiples.

6 CALL ME MO
Progressive and lightly raced colt. Last time recorded a nose second over 1400m at Newcastle.
Has the ability and is a definite each way hope.

5 BULLET FLY
Yet to break through this campaign but hasn't been far away including a last start third over
1400m at Newcastle. Form sound and looks an each way hope.

R6 - ROCKHAMPTON | 14:15 | AUD $17,000 |  RJC AWARDS NIGHT/SPRING HCP

1 LEPREEZY Had a winning run broken last time out when third at this track. Has each way claims.

2 CRIME BOSS
Lightly raced gelding progressing well. Last start posted a 4.25 lengths fourth over 1000m at
Townsville. Has the ability and looks one of the chances.

3 BANTU BAY
Ran on strongly and found a maiden win at this track last time out. Rates well and can continue
winning form. In the mix on best form.

6 BOSS BABY
No longer a maiden after a win at Mackay over 1200m last start, facing a rise in class this race.
Gets in well at the weights after a 3kg claim. Looking well suited this start.

7 FLAME PRINCESS
Broke maiden status at latest outing when winning at this track over 1050m, and faces a rise in
class this start. Might prove too much of a rise in class.

R7 - HAWKESBURY | 14:35 | AUD $35,000 |  FOWLER CIVIL CONTRACTING-BM64

2 MAGGIE MISS
Resumed with a strong all the way win at this track last start over 1100m. Appears to have come
back in good order off a break and can go on with it here. The one to beat.

7 MUMMENTUM
Promising type who is going for a hat-trick of wins, the latest success one length winner over
1300m at Scone. Form good for this and rates as a major player.

8 KEIAI TSUBAKI
Made all last start and came away with a win at this track over 1400m on August 31. Will
appreciate some weight relief with 3kg claim.

4 RENALOT
Drops in journey since last start at Wyong when seventh, ;nishing 3 lengths off the winner.
Jumps in weight but should be kept in mind.

3 POLYXENA
Winner two starts back at Canberra Acton which was followed up with a close fourth at Wagga.
Each way chance.

R8 - ROCKHAMPTON | 14:50 | AUD $17,000 |  XXXX GOLD SPRING CARNIVAL (C1)

5 METALLURGIST
Fitter for two runs back, the latest when 1.3 lengths win over 1200m at Kilcoy. Rates well here
and ready to show best

1 TALK'EMAROUND
Back from a four months spell following 4.5 lengths ;fth over 1400m at Ballarat Synthetic.
Consistent fresh up record and bold showing expected.

6 KATIE'S GIRL
Found maiden win last start at this track. Given a freshen up since that run and should be ;t
today. Looks a winning chance.

2 HIGHFALUTIN GAL
Fitter for recent racing and looks close to a win after ;nishing second over 1350m at Warwick
last time. Going well and worth including again.

3 DESPIRITO
Improved sharply at second run from a spell, running on strongly to ;nish a nose win over 1200
at Emerald. Fitter again and rates among the chances.
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R9 - HAWKESBURY | 15:10 | AUD $35,000 |  REDBANK NORTH RICHMOND (BM64)

1 GREAT DANGER
Nicely rated gelding. Scored a close win last start at Newcastle winning by a nose starting at
$3.00. Major player.

5 BOLD AND WILD
Consistent gelding. Broke through for maiden win at Wyong last time out. Won by a big margin
and seems to have plenty in hand. Should be close to peak ;tness. Should get box seat run. Take
beating.

7 PRIDE OF DARCI
Yet to break through this campaign but hasn't been far away including a last start fourth over
1500m at this track. Form good for this and is expected to run well.

3 SEDGEMOOR
Ran well below best last time and didn’t come on when eighth beaten by 7 lengths over 1400m at
Rosehill. Has ability and could sneak into the finish with the right run.

6 LIVE THE MOMENT
Honest galloper who returned from a spell with one length win over 1206m at Canberra Acton.
Fitter and looks an each way hope here.


