
A U STRA LIA  |         1

TIP SHEET
AUSTRALIA - 21st August 2019

R1 - CANTERBURY | 12:35 | AUD $50,000 |  KERMADEC @ DARLEY (BM72)

5 JUDGE JUDI
Has not been far away in recent times 4nishing third at Randwick two runs back which was
followed with a fifth last start. Goes up 150m in distance and must be considered.

4 FLYING PIERRO
Handy gelding racing in good form, 4nished mid4eld last time when third but beaten only 0.9
lengths over 1550m. Racing well and expected to measure up.

3 STRYKE ROCK
Won narrowly by a nose last time out at this track but will have to carry more weight. Major
Player.

1 TRAVANCORE
Recent form has been good including a win at Warwick Farm after running third two starts back.
Capable of going on with it here and has drawn well in barrier one. Right in this.

6 MONEGAL
Well deserved win last start after a close third two starts back. Drawn a good barrier here and will
be competitive again. One of the chances.

R2 - IPSWICH | 12:53 | AUD $35,000 |  THE LAST MYSTERY HCP (C3)

6 READY SET BOOM
Claims the highest peak Timeform rating of the 4eld. Finished a close second at Gatton over
1400m in latest outing. Will take catching.

4 COCO FASHION
Has not been far away in recent times 4nishing third at this track two runs back which was
followed with a second last start. Goes up 266m in distance and must be considered.

7 PRINCESS CAVALLO
Was underwhelming last start but if she can replicate the form of her third place run this track
two back she could give hope to this run. Expect improvement on recent efforts. Keep safe.

3 SPEAKING BAD
Racing well below best this campaign, the latest when 2 lengths fourth over 1600m at Sunshine
Coast. Has minor claims.

9 TE RANGI Nine-year-old gelding who tends to mix his form a bit. Looking to others who are more reliable.

R3 - CANTERBURY | 13:10 | AUD $50,000 |  ANZ BLOODSTOCK NEWS (BM70)

4 MISS SCORCHER
Ran well last start when not overly favoured at $17.00 at Randwick over 1200m. Looks well
suited.

5 SANGITA
Lightly raced mare progressing well. Last start posted a 1.3 lengths win over 1200m at Wyong.
Has the ability and can run a forward race.

1 DOLLY'S DUE
Dual acceptor. Six-year-old mare who has a liking for this distance with multiple wins at this
journey. Expected to be doing best work late.

8 MOVIE ROLE
Three-year-old 4lly resuming after showing some promise as a juvenile where she won at 1000m.
Worth thought on form from last campaign.

11 SUBPOENAED
Recorded a strong win at Te Rapa to break maiden status prior to a spell. Resumes after four
months break. Main contender.

R4 - IPSWICH | 13:28 | AUD $35,000 |  CARLTON MID (BM65)

6 BATTLE STRIKE
Found maiden win last start as favourite at this track. Must be considered again after what he's
shown in latest outings. In the mix on best form.

3 HEZHOME
Strong effort last start to win by 1.3 lengths at Rockhampton, rising in class today. Could 4nd
frame in best form.

8 GO DEEP
Racing well lately including a last start fourth over 1000m at Sunshine Coast and having 4rst
start at the journey today. Worth thought on latest effort.

5 BABY BOOMER
Lightly raced gelding progressing well. Last start posted a 2.25 lengths win over 1100m at this
track. Rates highly in this and expected to go close.

1 GUNTANTES
Resuming from a spell in this. Only career win came in metropolitan grade when winning as a
two-year-old. He has ability and with the drop in grade features as a top chance.
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R5 - CANTERBURY | 13:45 | AUD $50,000 |  TAB (BM72)

12 CAMP RIFLE
Strong effort last start to win by one length at Kembla Grange, rising in class today. Rates well
despite tougher race.

2 DON'T LEAVE ME OUT
Fitter and does have a solid second up record. Resumed with a 3.5 lengths 4fth over 1000m at
Randwick. Rates strongly and should go close.

11 CATWALK
Dual acceptor. After a sound debut got off the mark with a maiden win over 1000m at Randwick.
Has ability and should run well here.

5 KAWAIKINI
Struggling to break through lately, the latest finishing second over 1200m at this track. Rates well
and is among the chances.

9 VERSETTO
Resumes after a 13 months break after 4nishing 7 over 1400m at Warwick Farm. Fitter for a trial
win and could place with the right run.

R6 - IPSWICH | 14:03 | AUD $35,000 |  CHANNEL SEVEN HCP (65)

1 BLACK STRATA
Lightly raced four-year-old gelding recorded a strong win at Doomben to break maiden status
prior to going for a spell. Resumes after eight months break. Main contender.

2 CHIKORITA
Dual acceptor. Almost found the win last start running a close a neck second at Gold Coast over
1100m. Looking at a place here.

5 TRAIL OF GLORY
Resuming from a spell here. Has won when resuming and goes well over this distance. Raced in
much harder than this last preparation. Keep very safe.

6 ZYMATIC
Found maiden win last start at this track. Rates well and can continue winning form. Chance for
another win.

7 CHARWAY
Course and distance winner who is overdue for a win, the latest when sixth but beaten only 5.25
lengths over 1400m at Sunshine Coast. Thereabouts last time and is worth thought for the
multiples.

R7 - CANTERBURY | 14:20 | AUD $50,000 |  AUSTRALIAN TURF CLUB (BM72)

4 ONENESS
Has been close up in recent runs including a last start sixth over 1500m at Rosehill when only 1.8
lengths from the winner. Thereabouts lately and gets chance to break through.

5 ROCK
Resumes here after a 4ve months spell and a 900m Rosehill barrier trial where he placed. Form
last campaign was excellent and a forward showing is to be expected.

1 VICEROY
Out of the placings last time when seventh over a longer 1350m journey at Rosehill. Can make a
bold showing and rates an each way hope.

7 SUPERBOWL SUNDAY
Progressive and lightly raced gelding. Last time recorded a 2.5 lengths fourth over 1250m at this
track. Rates well and is worth including in the multiples.

3 CALABASAS
Close up second at Wyong two runs back then handy again at this track last start. Goes up
150m in distance and must be considered.

R8 - IPSWICH | 14:38 | AUD $35,000 |  TAB HCP (C2)

1 NICK THE SKIP
Shooting for a hat-trick of wins after making it two on end with one length win over 1300m at
Gold Coast. Going well and expected to prove hard to beat.

4 CHIKORITA
Dual acceptor. Progressive and lightly raced gelding. Last time recorded a neck second over
1100m at Gold Coast. Has the ability and is a definite each way hope.

2 OCEAN RULER
Won narrowly by a head last time out at Sunshine Coast but will have to carry more weight. Top
contender.

6 NOTONYA NELLY
Fitter for two runs from a spell and wasn’t far away when fourth over 1300m at Eagle Farm. Not
far away latest but win doesn’t look likely.

5 ROTHMAN
Almost found the win last start running a close 0.8 lengths second at this track over 1350m.
Looks close to a win here.
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R9 - CANTERBURY | 14:55 | AUD $50,000 |  CANTERBURY LEAGUE CLUB (BM72)

7 MISSYBEEL
Looks overdue for another win on recent form including a last start 4fth over 2000m at Rosehill.
Has the ability and looks one of the major players.

6 ULUSABA
Missed the placings last time over a longer trip when fourth over 2000m at Rosehill. Can improve
on last start and gets chance here.

4 MONASTERIO
Form solid including a last start fourth over 1900m at this track and has a good record at the
journey. Not far away last time. In the mix again.

5 ISLAND MISSILE
Ran well below best last time and didn’t come on when eighth beaten by 8 lengths over 1800m at
Randwick. Has ability and could sneak into the finish with the right run.

13 TOULOUSE
Struggling to break through lately, the latest 4nishing second over 1900m at this track. Has the
ability and is a definite each way hope.


