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TIP SHEET
UNITED KINGDOM - 23rd July 2020

R1 - WARRNAMBOOL | 12:30 | AUD $31,500 |  WESTERN DISTRICT AGRICTRE-BM64

9 DASHING TYCOON
Made it three placings this campaign two back at Donald over 1624m. Ran seventh at this track
by 8.75 lengths last start. At peak now, can expect bold run.

4 CAMPOBASSO
Handy stayer racing below best including last start when well held over 1600m at Moonee Valley
on July 12 when well supported. Rates highly here though and expected to do much better.

5 RIDING HIGH Missed last time but excuses there. Form prior good for this.

1 JIMMY'S SECRET
Broke through two back but ran well below best latest when a 13 length eighth over 1600m at
Sandown-Hillside.

6 UNDER THE BRIDGE
Placed two on end before a break but disappointing fresh when beaten a long way into Afth over
1700m at this track. Better than last start and can do better this time.

R2 - WARRNAMBOOL | 13:00 | AUD $31,500 |  LUDEMAN REAL ESTATE (BM64)

4 CASH FOR DIAMONDS
Returned to the winners circle after a long while last time out at Bendigo scoring by 6 lengths.
Last start winner who rates highly again here.

3 CALIBURN
Winner of his last two starts and looking for a hat-trick. He's been winning a bit in reserve and
you can't knock winning form. Today's race will be harder, but can step up to the mark.

8 ALLABOUTATTITUDE
Poor winning strike rate overall with just four wins from 61 starts, latest was win over 2350m at
this track. Has the ability and looks one of the major players.

7 LEVEN LASS
Kept coming last time over 1614m at Moe to Anish Afth and will appreciate the extra ground
here. Should be at top now and may be worth another chance.

11 CUBAN FIGHTER
Capable galloper but out of the placings last few runs, the latest when fourth over 2350m at this
track on July 5. Decent overall record and worth including among the chances.

R3 - WARRNAMBOOL | 13:30 | AUD $31,500 |  BROTHER FOX FOOD (BM64)

2 THE EXECUTIONER
This preparation only missed the place once. Last start second at Moonee Valley when well
supported. Low draw and expected to go close.

8 WILD VITALITY
Nicely rated galloper. Scored a close win last start at Echuca in the wet winning by a head
starting at $4.50. Should be right there in the finish.

7 TOFF CHOICE
Ran on strongly and found a maiden win at Cranbourne as favourite last time out. Rates well and
can continue winning form. Looks a winning chance.

1 CHORTOMIC
Running well recently including a last start fourth by 1.6 lengths over 1600m at CaulAeld. Rates
highly in this and is worth another try.

4 SAVVY BOY
Was well beaten at Moonee Valley when eighth before being sent for a spell. First up here and
showed potential last preparation. Not out of it.

R4 - WARRNAMBOOL | 14:00 | AUD $31,500 |  WDEA WORKS EMPLOYMENT (BM64)

5 STAR FINDER
Has not been far away in recent times and was a last start winner at Warracknabeal. Should be
competitive this start, looks a great chance to make it two in row.

6 GLASS CEILING
Resumes in this after two months off. Placed at all starts fresh. Hasn't trialled in the lead up to
this so fitness is the only query. Can take this.

2 FORBID ME NOT
Strong run last time out at Bendigo over 1100m in the wet on July 3. Has claims in this race if
she can reproduce that form today. Apprentice rides here claiming 1.5kg. Must be respected.

3 BUCK BAY Good effort when third at Ballarat Synthetic over 1200m last start. Must be respected.

8 TOUCH OF PARADISE
Missed the placings last time over a longer journey when fourth over 1300m at Sandown-
Lakeside. Rates fairly and shouldn’t be far away.
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R5 - WARRNAMBOOL | 14:30 | AUD $31,500 |  SOUTH WEST KITCHENS (BM64)

4 DINGA
Recent runs have more merit to them than may Arst seem. Is capable over this distance having
claimed a prior success at the trip. One of the contenders here.

5 BALLE D'OR
Solid performances at both starts this campaign. Ready to improve now and has won over this
distance. The one to beat.

1 LIDO BEACH
Handy gelding who has already racked up four wins. Form sound, the latest when 1.6 lengths
fourth over 1200m at Belmont Park. Rates highly here and is right in the mix again.

8 FOUNTAIN OF YOUTH
Returned from a spell when second at Murray Bridge Has had two starts back from a spell and
has finished in the placings both times. Third up here and will be fitter for the two runs.

2 BOMBSHELL BELLE
Won three of seven career runs to date, the latest Anishing ninth over 1000m at Sandown-
Hillside. Rates highly and expected to be in the finish.


