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TIP SHEET
SOUTH AFRICA - 25th March 2020

R1 - FAIRVIEW AW | 19:00 | ZAR R60,000 |  ITSARUSH.CO.ZA WELCOMES YOU MAIDEN PLATE

8 ALL THE STARS
Promising -lly with placings at both career runs to date. Last start was second over 6 1/2f at this
track. Rates highly is among the leading hopes.

1 HOLLYWOOD THUNDER
Has placed at six of eight starts this time in, -nishing in the money again last time as favourite
at this track. Overdue for a win and expected to go close again.

3 SILVER FOUNTAIN
Battled last start to -nish seventh at Kenilworth. Can forget last start getting a chance here
today.

4 QUEEN MAKEDA
Produced some good performances recently, most recently second at Fairview. Rises in trip.
Strong place chance.

2 MYSTIC TULIP
Turned challenging and fought on well, fading late to miss the placings over 6f at this track. Is
worth including for a value bet.

R2 - FAIRVIEW AW | 19:30 | ZAR R60,000 |  ALL TO COME MAIDEN PLATE

1 LADY OF CHOICE
Fair effort when third at this track last start when well in the market and has to have claims if she
can run up to that form again. Third up now and looks a strong winning chance.

2 SALVADORA
Running well recently including a last start second by 1.75 lengths over 1 3/16m at this track.
Thereabouts lately and rates among the leading hopes.

5 BILLI ANN
Solid effort last start as favourite showing good ability. Up in the weights now but still appeals as
well treated and should take plenty from that run. Contender.

4 GREEN EDITION Battled last start to finish sixth at Fairview. Can expect a better showing this time out.

3 BELFAST CHILD
Out of the placings lately including a last start ninth over 1m at this track. Having -rst start at
the journey today and shouldn’t be far away

R3 - FAIRVIEW AW | 20:00 | ZAR R60,000 |  TAB PAYS THE FULL DIVIDEND, NO LIMITS MAIDEN PLATE

3 JACKPOT JEWEL
Still a maiden but continues to make progress, the latest -nishing second over 1m at Fairview.
Expected to measure up.

1 FALLING FOR YOU
Performing well since debut placing three races from six starts and could -nally break through
here.

2 GHALYOON
Remains a maiden after seven career runs but will jump from a wide draw here after -nishing
-fth over 1m at Vaal last time. Best efforts give him a chance here and is a de-nite winning
chance this time.

6 MARK THE DOORMAN
Resumes after a two months break when -nishing -fth over 7f at this track. Rates highly and
should run well.

4 UP EARLY
Four start maiden ran seventh last start being beaten by 15 lengths over 1m at Turffontein
Inside. Rates well on best form and is worth including in the multiples.

R4 - FAIRVIEW AW | 20:30 | ZAR R65,000 |  RACING ASSOCIATION GRADUATION PLATE

7 MIGHTY ROCK
Racing well below best this campaign, the latest when 4.25 lengths fourth over 1 1/8m at
Fairview. Ratings suggest he has claims here.

10 LATEST CRAZE
Poor winning strike rate overall with just one win from 13 starts, latest was eighth over 1m at
Fairview. Rates highly on best form and expected to measure up.

2 JURIST Well deserved win last start after a close third two starts back. Looks well placed.

9 HOPEFUL
Five-year-old mare who drops in journey since last start at Fairview when fourth, -nishing 3.25
lengths off the winner. Leading contender.

8 MALDIVES
Powered home to win with style by 1.25 lengths at Fairview last start, rises in class this start. In
this mix in this tougher field.
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R5 - FAIRVIEW AW | 21:00 | ZAR R50,000 |  VISIT TABONLINE MR 68 HANDICAP

2 LION KING
Looks close to a win following a 6 1/2f placing at this track where he ran on well for second
beaten one length. Overdue and looks one of the leading chances.

5 MARMARA SEA
Progressive and lightly raced gelding. Last time recorded a 3.25 lengths win over 5f at this track.
Has the ability and expected to run well.

1 BENEFICIARY
Progressive and lightly raced -lly. Last time recorded a half a length second over 5f at this track.
Rates highly in this and expected to go close.

7 NOVEMBER STORM
Notched up another placing last time out over 5f at this track to make it two on end. Racing well
and can break through this time.

3 MICROBE
Poor winning strike rate overall with just three wins from 34 starts, latest was win over 6f at this
track. Has the ability and looks one of the chances.

R6 - FAIRVIEW AW | 21:30 | ZAR R67,500 |  COMPUTAFORM EXPRESS FM 91 DIVIDED HANDICAP

2 CAPTAIN'S PRINCESS
Improved twice over to place second at this track last time out over 6f. Looks well placed and
rates highly off that run. Top chance.

1 CAUSE AND EFFECT
Made a return to form with a third place -nish over 5f at this track at big odds. Solid run latest
and rates a strong winning hope again.

4 SAO PAULO
Doesn't win out of turn but has found -ve wins and seventeen places from forty two starts. Could
find a win looking well suited.

9 TRAVEL IN STYLE
Ran a fair result two back at this track and distance, running fourth by 1.8 lengths. Her best can
take this.

8 SEATTLE TANGO
Finished 11th last start over 6f at Fairview. Rarely wins, with just 2 successes from 30 starts.
Rates well and is among the chances.

R7 - FAIRVIEW AW | 22:00 | ZAR R45,000 |  BETTING WORLD - 087 741 2777 FM 74 DIVIDED HANDICAP

6 MISS ORANGE
Galloper with a good career winning three races seven runs, last start -nishing -rst over 5f at this
track. Has the ability and expected to run well.

5 LOVE TALK
Covered ground throughout and ran into the placings when a 3.5 lengths third over 6 1/2f at this
track. Racing well. Has strong claims.

8 ELUSIVE DIVA
Fairly honest mare but does -nd it hard to win. Course and distance winner, the latest when sixth
over 6 1/2f at this track. Struggling to break through but gets chance here.

9 LINDA LOVES LACE
Lightly raced -lly progressing well. Last start posted a 0.75 lengths win over 6f at this track. Has
the ability and is a definite each way hope.

1 BELIEVETHISBEAUTY
Races well over this distance range and has a number of performances that give her a showing
today. Not beaten far latest and worth including.

R8 - FAIRVIEW AW | 22:35 | ZAR R50,000 |  NEXT FAIRVIEW RACEMEETING FRIDAY 27 MARCH FM 66 HANDICAP

6 FORGET O' GIRLS
Displayed sharp improvement when breaking through for her maiden win last start at this track.
Found winning form now and can measure up again.

1 DEEP RIVER WOMAN
Beaten by a 0.25 lengths when second at this track on 1 3/16m in latest effort. Looks a good
chance on that form.

10 TAWNY JET
Progressive and lightly raced -lly. Last time recorded a 3.25 lengths second over 6 1/2f at this
track. Rates highly in this and expected to go close.

12 LADYSMITH
Latest ran in third over 6f at this track, rarely winning with just one success from 27 starts. Has
the ability and can run a forward race.

3 CHERRY POP
Broke through for an overdue win last time over 6 1/2f at this track. Back in form and bold
showing expected.


