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TIP SHEET
SOUTH AFRICA - 30th July 2020

R1 - VAAL | 18:10 | ZAR R60,000 |  SOCIAL DISTANCING WORKRIDERS MAIDEN PLATE

1 NAZARETH
Solid effort last start showing good ability. Up in the weights now but still appeals as well treated
and should take plenty from that run. Genuine chance.

4 THEATRE OF DREAMS
Improved twice over to place second at this track last time out over 1000m. Looks well placed
and rates highly off that run. Expected in the finish.

2 REGARDS TO ALL Resumes today after showing some ability in her debut prep placing once. Rates highly today.

3 SPECTRAL
Resumed at this track over 1000m and missed the frame, ;nishing fourth and beaten 5.5
lengths. Further improved and expected to do much better here.

5 NU BELL
Handy ;lly racing in good form, ;nished mid;eld last time when sixth but beaten only 2.5
lengths over 1200m. Has the ability and is expected to run well again.

R2 - VAAL | 18:40 | ZAR R60,000 |  WASH YOUR HANDS MAIDEN PLATE

1 CURIOUS
Couldn't go on with it after leading early and ;nished just off the winner last start at Turffontein
Inside when in the market. Has one placings from 2 runs this prep, commands respect.

2 FISTS OF FIRE
Form since resuming has been disappointing, last start ran in ;fth over 1160m at Turffontein
Standside. Easier here and gets chance to show form.

5 BINGWA
Open to much improvement after a fair debut when fourth over 1160m at Turffontein Standside.
Shows ability and looks hard to beat.

8 ELIUD Gelding by Futura from the dam Entrechat who makes debut. Expected to run well.

11 PLAYBOY PRINCE
Missed the frame when resuming from a spell when a 5 length fourth at this track. Further
improved and expected to do much better here.

R3 - VAAL | 19:15 | ZAR R60,000 |  INTERBET.CO.ZA - 0861 150 160 MAIDEN HANDICAP

2 SECRET GLIDER
Resumed over 1600m and missed the placings when a 9.75 lengths eighth at Turffontein
Standside. Further improved and expected to do much better here.

5 CHAMPINGATTHEBIT
Good effort when ;fth at this track over 1450m last start. Ratings give him a strong chance in
this event on that latest effort. Looms as a top chance.

9 HOUSE MASTER
Backs after a good run last week at Turffontein Inside over 1450m. Has claims in this race if he
can reproduce that form today. Worthy of consideration.

3 BRAVESTARR
Form since resuming has been disappointing, last start ran in ;fth over 1600m at Turffontein
Standside. Easier here and gets chance to show form.

11 FOREVER LIGHT
Needs to bounce back after an underwhelming performance last start, if he can replicate the
form of a second place run at this track two back then he can stack up today. Well held latest but
rates highly here.

R4 - VAAL | 19:50 | ZAR R60,000 |  TAB PAYS THE FULL DIVIDEND, NO LIMITS MAIDEN HANDICAP

1 GAL GADOT
Looked a run short when a 4.5 lengths ;fth at Turffontein Inside resuming last start. Further
improved and expected to do much better here.

2 SERENITY
Could only manage ;fth at this track last start. Can overlook last start rating a much better
chance today.

3 COTOPAXI
Battled last start to ;nish eighth at Turffontein Standside. Can overlook last start rating a much
better chance today.

8 SEA ISLAND
Back from a six months spell following 23 lengths 12th over 1450m at this track. Rates highly
here and looks well placed here fresh.

4 HIGHTAIL
Resumed at Turffontein Inside over 1450m and missed the frame, ;nishing seventh and beaten
9.5 lengths. Further improved and expected to do much better here.
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R5 - VAAL | 20:25 | ZAR R60,000 |  STAY SAFE WITH A MASK MAIDEN HANDICAP

1 ROMANTIC ERA
Went down by a neck to ;nish second at Turffontein Inside over 2600m as favourite in latest
outing. Winning chance.

2 GREAT ESTEEM
Continued honest form last time out when placing over 2000m at Turffontein Inside. Racing well
and can go on with it.

5 TRICKY BUSINESS
Looked a run short when a 3.25 lengths fourth at Turffontein Inside resuming last start. Rates
highly and is among the leading hopes here second-up. Fitter for the run and expected to be in
the finish this time.

10 ELECTRA FLYING
Started this campaign with poor form, last start recording eighth by 6.5 lengths over 1600m at
Turffontein Standside. Has the ability and can bounce back on best form.

4 GREY STREET
Yet to break through in eighteen runs but wasn't far away last time at third over 2600m at
Turffontein Inside on July 16. Went close last time and should be in the finish.

R6 - VAAL | 21:00 | ZAR R60,000 |  BETTINGWORLD.BET MIDDLE STAKES

7 GOLD GRIFFIN
Couldn't replicate form second up after winning two back at Turffontein Inside over 2600m. Can
forget last start and rate off winning form.

11 DANCE CLASS
Shooting for a hat-trick of wins after making it two on end with one length win over 2400m at
this track. Rates highly and should go close.

1 CHRISTOPHER ROBIN
Stepping up 500m in distance after a good last start win. 4.0kg up in the weights from last start
but still holds appeal.

5 CHARIOT OF GOLD
Well rated mare who scored a close win last start at Turffontein Inside winning by 0.25 lengths
starting at $3.20. Can go close here.

3 ODD ROB
Missed the frame when resuming from a spell when a 4.5 lengths tenth at Turffontein Inside.
Further improved and expected to do much better here.

R7 - VAAL | 21:35 | ZAR R60,000 |  VISIT TABONLINE FM 83 HANDICAP

3 ELUSIVE FORCE Finished a close third at this track over 1600m as favourite in latest outing. Will take beating.

4 KAPAMA Ran a fair result two back at this course and distance, running fifth by 2.25 lengths. Major player.

5 TARGARYEN QUEEN Second up in this. Hasn't drawn the best gate for this but still looks a winning hope.

6 LOUVAIN
Was underwhelming last run as favourite. Showed her better form two back placing third at this
track over 1450m. Has the ability to be in the finish.

7 LONELY NIGHT
Didn't inspire last start beaten 4.2L at this track. Can overlook last start rating a much better
chance today.

R8 - VAAL | 22:10 | ZAR R60,000 |  TAB TELEBET 0861 000 822 CLASSIFIED STAKES

5 WAQAAS
Fitter for recent racing and looks close to a win after ;nishing fourth over 1600m at Turffontein
Inside last time. Rates highly here and can measure up.

2 DARK TIDE
Broke maiden status at latest outing when winning at this track over 1200m, and faces a rise in
class this start. Gets the chance to win again.

7 CATEGORY FOUR Finished a close second at this track over 1200m last start. Improver. Top Hope.

6 VARIMAX
Improved twice over to place third at Turffontein Inside last time out over 1200m. Looks well
placed and rates highly off that run. Further improvement expected.

1 WHIPPING BOY
Poor winning strike rate overall with just one win from 23 starts, latest was seventh over 1600m
at this track. Has the ability and can run a forward race.
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R9 - VAAL | 22:45 | ZAR R60,000 |  COVID-19 NATIONAL CRISIS HELPLINE 0800029999 FM 76 HANDICAP

2 SOUL OF WIT
Yet to recapture best form after two runs from a break, the latest ;nishing ;fth over 1450m at
Turffontein Inside. Further improved and gets chance to break through.

6 PERSICA
Progressive and lightly raced ;lly. Last time recorded a 4.5 lengths fourth over 1200m at this
track. Has the ability and looks one of the major players.

1 HEART OF A LEGEND
Hit and miss galloper who ran well below best last time when a 8.75 lengths seventh over 1400m
at this track. Has the ability and is among the hopes on best form.

5 SHEER TALENT
Lightly raced ;lly progressing well. Last start posted a 1.5 lengths win over 1200m at this track.
Rates highly in this and expected to be in the finish.

13 SPEECHMAKER
Resumed over 1000m and missed the placings when a 2.25 lengths sixth at this track. Further
improved and expected to do much better here.


