
P E RTH  |        1

TIP SHEET
PERTH - 17th November 2020

R1 - ROCKHAMPTON | 12:40 | AUD $18,000 |  HCP

2 BUFFY
Racing in great form with wins at her last two, the latest over 1200m at this track when scoring
by half a length. Rates highly and expected to measure up.

1 ABSOLUT ARTIE
Resumes here after a three months spell and a 900m Rockhampton barrier trial where he placed
in a barrier trial. Form last campaign was excellent and a forward showing is to be expected.
Must be respected first up.

5 STEELZ TIME
Fair effort second at Townsville last start when in the market and has to have claims if he can
run up to that form again. One to keep in mind.

3 DAUNTING QUEEN
Was well fancied last time but ran well below par, ?nishing ninth and beaten 8 lengths over
1400m at Kumbia. Disappointing latest but could find form here.

4 JAY JAY
Was well fancied last time but ran well below par, ?nishing ?fth and beaten 4 lengths over
1400m at Yeppoon. Previous form sound but prepared to risk.

R2 - ROCKHAMPTON | 13:15 | AUD $18,000 |  (BM65)

2 SRINI
Fitter for two runs back, the latest when half a length win over 1300m at this track. Rates well
here and ready to show best.

6 STRAWBERRY BLONDE
Looks overdue for another win on recent form including a last start sixth over 1400m at this
track. Has the ability and can run a forward race.

5 IFYOUKNOWHATIMEAN
Should be ready to improve after two runs back, the latest when third over 1300m at Mackay.
Rates highly here and expected to run well.

1 GALAPAGOS
Fairly consistent type who ran well below best latest when 4.5 lengths eighth over 1200m at this
track. Rarely far away and looks a place hope.

4 APPLICANT
Kept coming last time over 1400m at this track to ?nish third and will appreciate the extra
ground here. Rates strongly here and shouldn't be far away.

R3 - ROCKHAMPTON | 13:50 | AUD $18,000 |  HCP (C2)

3 ASK NINO
Won two of ?ve career runs to date, the latest ?nishing ?rst over 1400m at this track. Rates
highly and expected to go close.

4 MYSTERY ELEMENT
Has not been far away in recent times and was a last start winner at this track. Should be
competitive this start, looks well placed.

1 LOUIE THE LEGEND
Fitter for recent racing and looks close to a win after ?nishing ?fth over 1100m at this track last
time. Form good for this and rates as a major player.

5 PROVOCATIVE MAN
Has been racing well in recent times including a win two starts back at this track before running
fifth at Ipswich last start. In the mix here.

2 ROCK 'N' SOL
Was underwhelming last start but if he can replicate the form of his third place run Mackay two
back he could give hope to this run. Will be doing best work late.

R4 - ROCKHAMPTON | 14:25 | AUD $18,000 |  HCP (C2)

5 POETIC FINAL SAY
Ran well last start when just out of the market at $13 at this track over 1300m. Can improve on
last.

3 SPIRITOMO
Fell just short of ?nishing in the placings when fourth at Toowoomba over 1210m. Country class
will be easier today. Should be competitive here.

1 BROKEN HERO
Disappointed last time when well beaten to ?nish sixth beaten by 7 lengths over 1050m at
Doomben. Can forget latest and have a better run.

7 PRINCESS RULES
Will strip much ?tter for the two runs since a spell, the latest when a 2.5 lengths fourth over
1300m at this track. Rates well and definitely worth including in the multiples.

4 AERIAL COMBAT
Given a break following a below par run when ninth, beaten 8 lengths over 1350m at Doomben.
Has ability and is an each way chance on best form.
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R5 - ROCKHAMPTON | 15:00 | AUD $18,000 |  (BM70)

2 THREE STRIPES Resuming today after a successful first prep winning two from nine starts. Rates highly today.

1 ABSOLUTE BONZA Given a freshen up after a last start win at Taroom and has trialled leading into this. In the mix.

6 PARISIAN TYCOON
Returns here after ?nishing ninth over 1200m at this track before a four months break. Rates well
with a solid fresh record and expected to measure up.

3 UMBERTO
Was unplaced and well beaten in all runs last campaign, the latest when tenth over 1100m at
this track.

8 KINGS COUNTY
Resuming today. Doesn't usually ?re early on and tends to do his best work a bit later. Place
looks his best chance.

R6 - ROCKHAMPTON | 15:35 | AUD $18,000 |  HCP (55)

7 SENDING LOVE
Broke through at this track for her maiden win over 1200m last start and coming into a harder
field this start. Gets the chance to win again.

6 MISS READY NOW
Not disgraced in small ?elds of late and racing very genuinely at present. Last start ran third
when well supported at Kumbia over 1200m. Good chance on best.

4 WIDE LOAD
Resumes here after a six months spell and expect him to be race ?t with a couple of barrier trials
under his belt. Form last campaign was excellent and on home track expect a forward showing.
Can continue winning run here.

3 DELAGO EDITION
Finished off last campaign with a eighth over 1100m at this track on April 21. Rates strongly and
despite the wide draw don’t discount altogether.

11 ROSAIRE
Made a strong run to ?nish seventh over 1200m at this track and will relish the extra ground
here. Should be at peak fitness now and should be in the mix.


