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TIP SHEET
AUSTRALIA - 17th September 2021

R1 - QUEANBEYAN | 12:35 | AUD $22,000 |  JOSEPH JONES RACING PLATE (C1)

11 MORE EXCITEMENT
Narrowly beaten last time when second at this track, 6nishing just a nose from the winner. Right
in the mix again.

12 CHEEKY NUGGET
Handy gelding who 6nished seventh last start but was beaten only 1.75 lengths over 1400m at
Nowra. Rates highly and should run well.

2 ROMAN CANDLE
Not disgraced in small 6elds of late and racing very genuinely at present. Last start ran second
when well in the market at this track over 1600m on a heavy surface. Good chance on best.

8 EPIZEEL
Well in the market last but ran well below best when a 8 length 6fth over 1460m at this track.
Rates highly here and rates among the leading chances.

1 BURNT PATCH
Ran on strongly to land his maiden win at this track last time out. Found winning form and can
go on with it.

R2 - NEWCASTLE | 12:50 | AUD $50,000 |  OAS TECHNOLOGY HURRICANE HCP

4 CAPITAL REIGN
Handy gelding who has already recorded three wins. Going well, including a win last start over
1007m at Taree. Expected to measure up.

2 MALAHAT
Returns from a spell after 6nishing second at his last appearance over 1000m at Gunnedah on
May 30. Has a useful first-up record. Expected to run well.

6 AKASAKI
Resuming from a spell of four months. Last raced when eighth over 900m at this track. Boasts a
solid record when fresh from a break. Expected to run well.

1 STAR BOY
Was safely held when resuming over 1000m in the G3 Concorde Stakes at Randwick, 6nishing
eighth and beaten 18 lengths. Has won second up and looks a definite each-way hope.

5 THE NEON KNIGHT
Has struggled to be consistent this preparation. Finished well off the pace last start at Randwick.
Drops 200m here which she will appreciate. Willing to give one more chance.

R3 - QUEANBEYAN | 13:10 | AUD $34,000 |  TAB FEDERAL (BM75)

7 PROPOSE A TOAST
Handy gelding who has already registered three wins. Going well, including a win last start over
1400m at Kembla Grange. One of the major players.

3 DELACOUR
Followed a second-up win at Canberra Acton two starts back with a solid second at this track
over 1200m on August 24. In the mix on best form.

4 CYBORG
Five-year-old gelding who drops in distance from the latest outing when 6fth over 1425m at
Moruya, finishing 1.5 lengths off the winner. Can improve enough to take this out.

1 JAWWAAL
Consistent type who was far from disgraced when 6fth at Randwick Kensington last start, after
just missing narrowly when second at Randwick Kensington. Will appreciate the class drop.
Rates on top.

6 ZELAGO
Back from a spell of four-and-a-half months. Last raced when beaten 10 lengths into 14th over
1200m at Wagga. In the mix.

R4 - NEWCASTLE | 13:25 | AUD $50,000 |  RARITY WHOLESALE (C1)

3 DHAKURI
Resumed over 1400m at Randwick Kensington last start and 6nished 8 lengths away in 6fth.
Fitter and can break through.

9 AMORE
Ran on strongly to score her maiden win at Wyong as favourite last time out. Shapes as a
leading chance again.

8 EYES TO EYE
Promising gelding who did well to 6nish third on debut then backed that up with a nice win last
time over 1500m at Hawkesbury. Can build on that bright start to his career.

1 CALAVERAS
Raced on the pace from a wide draw last time over 2100m at Tuncurry then tired late to 6nish
sixth. Looks ready to return to form.

13 RAGING BULL
Finished mid6eld last start at Hawkesbury over 1500m when resuming as a $3 favourite. First
look at this longer trip. Strong contender on his best form.
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R5 - QUEANBEYAN | 13:45 | AUD $22,000 |  TAB LONG MAY WE PLAY HCP (C1)

1 SUPERTANKER
Consistent mare but hasn’t won for a while. Put the writing on the wall last time over 1300m at
Hawkesbury when third and beaten 1.75 lengths. Rates highly and should feature.

2 BIG STEVE
Won 6rst up two back at Moruya but couldn't go on with it at Moruya last time out. Looks a
strong chance on that form.

12 DIFFERENT TIME
Racing well below her best this campaign, last start 6nishing 4 lengths away in sixth over 1200m
at this track. Well placed and can improve sharply.

8 BRING IT BELLA
Resumed over 1206m at Canberra Acton last start and 6nished 9 lengths away in seventh. Rates
highly and should improve sharply. Fitter for that run and expected to be in the finish this time.

4 LENNY'S LAD
Poor winning strike rate overall with just one win from 16 starts. Last start 6nished third over
1200m at this track. Well placed this time and expected to be in the finish.

R6 - NEWCASTLE | 14:05 | AUD $160,000 |  YARRAMAN PARK TIBBIE STKS

2 MORE PROPHETS
Consistent galloper with 6ve wins and six minors from 14 runs. Good return in a Listed Race
when a head win over 1350m at Wyong. Has ability and is expected to be in the finish.

4 GREAT NEWS Finished a close third last time out at Wyong over 1350m. Expected to be very competitive.

1 CHARLEISE
Had been racing very well but was below her best last time when 4.5 lengths back in ninth over
1350m at Wyong. Rates highly and deserves another chance.

3 BRING THE RANSOM
Was beaten just a head when second at her latest appearance at Wyong over 1350m. Expected
to feature.

7 OUTBACK DIVA
Yet to break through this campaign but hasn't been far away including a last start fourth over
1350m at Wyong. Rates highly here and should be right in the mix again.

R7 - QUEANBEYAN | 14:25 | AUD $22,000 |  SEEARS WORKWEAR (BM60)

2 MORE SHOTS
Returns from a spell after 6nishing ninth at her last appearance over 1607m at Sapphire Coast
on May 2. Can make an immediate impact.

7 REBELLIOUS MISS
Got home by 1.3 lengths at Nowra two starts ago. Disappointed last time at Randwick when 9
lengths from the winner in 13th. Huge chance on best. Worth another try.

3 SKYRAY
Fitter for recent racing and looks close to a win after 6nishing 6fth over 1500m at Muswellbrook
last time. Racing well and expected to measure up again.

5 SUBTLY SPRING
Five-year-old gelding who kept his unblemished record at this course intact when scoring by 2
lengths over 2000m last time. Rates strongly and on top record here expected to run well.

4 CHARLIE'S LAW
Not disgraced in small 6elds of late and racing very genuinely at present. Last start ran third
when in the market at Port Macquarie over 1500m. Backs up quickly. Go well.

R8 - NEWCASTLE | 14:40 | AUD $250,000 |  SHARP OFFICE NEWCASTLE CUP

3 BERDIBEK
Shooting for a hat-trick of wins after making it two on end with 1.75 lengths win over 2100m at
Wyong. In great form and can go on with it here.

5 LAURE ME IN
Settled back but kept coming to 6nish 6fth over 2100m at Wyong last start. Nicely placed and is
expected to be in the finish.

6 HARPO MARX
Stepping up 300m in distance after a good last start win at Kembla Grange. Facing a 3.0kg hike
in the weights from the last start but still makes plenty of appeal.

9 CRIMINAL CODE
Has been knocking on the door including a last start second over 2100m at Wyong when only
1.75 lengths from the winner. Genuine type who gets his chance.

7 HUSH WRITER
Resumes after a 132-day break. Won a barrier trial on 30-Aug-21. Looks forward enough and has
won first up before. One of the major players.

R9 - QUEANBEYAN | 15:05 | AUD $22,000 |  AFFINITY ELECTR. TECHNO.-BM60

10 NEPHRADIVA
Three-year-old 6lly resumes after showing plenty last campaign as a juvenile. Can kick off with a
big run.

11 MO MORE CHICKEN
Has been out of the money recently including last start when sixth over 1000m at Wagga three
weeks ago, beaten 4.5 lengths. Tough to beat if near her best.

9 MISS DEVINCI
Handy mare who is a three time winner. Raced close to the speed and returned to winning ways
over 1000m. Back in form and can go on with it.

8 DEVIATE
Scored over 1000m at this track two back then missed the frame last time out over 1100m at
Wyong. Tough to beat on best. Can atone.
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R10 - NEWCASTLE | 15:20 | AUD $160,000 |  AUST. BLOODSTOCK CAMERON HCP

3 ROCK
Settled well off the pace last start then made steady ground to 6nish fourth over 1400m at
Randwick. Ready to peak after two runs back and is a winning chance.

5 FROSTY ROCKS
Back to earth last time out last time out when seventh over 1400m at Caul6eld. No surprise to
see him back in the winners' circle.

4 DUAIS
Consistent type resuming here after 104 day break and has won 6rst up before. Trialled at
Hawkesbury over 900m in preparation for this. Has to be included.

9 ITZ LILY
Dual acceptor. Went down by just half a length when second at Randwick over 1500m last time
out. Tough to beat.

12 SOLDIER OF LOVE
Consistent galloper who has had two runs back from a spell. Last start scored by half a length
over 1500m at Randwick. Rates highly and is ready to peak.


