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TIP SHEET
PERTH - 02nd December 2020

R1 - BUNBURY | 13:09 | AUD $25,000 |  THE PASSIONATE BAKER (RS0LY)

5 SENTIMENTAL HERO
Made a pleasing start to his career, scoring a debut win at Northam. Likely to be starting
favourite and sets the standard here.

4 NOBEL LAURENCE
Promising gelding who built on sound debut run with a maiden success last time over 1400m at
this track. Shows good ability and looks hard to beat.

1 NO SURRENDER
Went close to breaking through when a narrow third over 1400m at Ascot last start. In the mix
coming into this start.

3 SON SON
After winning on debut was in the placings at only other run when a half a length second over
1400m at Ascot. Form sound and must be included.

2 GHOST WHO WALKS
Lightly raced gelding progressing well. Last start posted a 2.25 lengths second over 1200m at
Ascot. Needs to do more.

R2 - BUNBURY | 13:44 | AUD $20,000 |  CAPEL VALE WINEY MDN

9 TESTING LOVE
Went down by half a length to >nish second at this track over 1200m in most recent effort as
favourite. Main contender.

8 DOOWAHDIDDY
Settled back from wide out but got home nicely into the placings over 1500m at Ascot and
stretches out in journey here. Well placed here and should be in the finish.

2 BALDERDASH
Has been close up in recent runs including a last start fourth over 1410m at this track when only
2.5 lengths from the winner. Has the ability and expected to run well.

7 TENA KOUTOU
Blackfriars gelding from the mare Aloha Miss who is making debut. Fitter for a trial placing
leading into this and looks set for a fair debut.

3 GALAGA
Got into the placings for the first time last start when a 1.2 lengths third over 1410m at this track.
Improver who comes into calculations.

R3 - BUNBURY | 14:19 | AUD $20,000 |  SOUTH WEST CLEANING MDN

4 CRESCENT CITY
Gelding by Fiorente from the dam New Orleans who makes debut. Last trial was runner-up at
Lark Hill barrier trial over 950m 16-Nov-20. Rates strongly and should run well.

3 COMEALILBITCLOSER
Drops in distance since last start at this track when second, >nishing 3 lengths off the winner.
Appears to be a top chance.

7 ARRACITY
Improving start after start >nding a place most recently at this track over 1410m. Should >nd the
frame here.

5 FANDAZZLE
Kept coming last time over 1300m at Northam to >nish seventh and will appreciate the extra
ground here. Looks well placed here and among the leading chances.

1 MAGNUSON MAN
Form since resuming has been disappointing, last start ran in sixth over 1000m at Albany.
Disappointing latest but don't underestimate.

R4 - BUNBURY | 15:00 | AUD $20,000 |  BULL & BUSH TAVERN MDN

2 MATERIAL WITNESS
Went back on debut and missed the frame when >fth at Northam. Open to further improvement.
Better for the experience and can measure up.

8 MISS ALIGNED
Returned from a spell last start when runner up beaten one length at this track on November 22
over 1108m. Drawn well and suited here, should get run of the race. Winning chance.

6 OLDEN Resumes today after showing some ability in his debut prep placing once. Rates highly today.

11 NOBELLITY
Resumed at Ascot over 1200m and missed the frame, >nishing tenth and beaten 5.5 lengths.
Rates highly and expected to >nish much closer. Fitter for the run and expected to be in the >nish
this time.

5 ZAC LUVS TO FLY
Found himself positioned up on the speed at this track last start and worked home nicely,
running second. Wasn't far off the winner there. Worth some thought here on the back of latest
effort.
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R5 - BUNBURY | 15:35 | AUD $20,000 |  FURPHY - REFRESHING ALE MDN

10 NIGHT SESSION Been close at both her two starts in this time. Ready to improve now. Must be respected.

1 THE ROAN RANGER
14 start maiden close to a win after a narrow loss last time when second over 1675m at this
track. Went close last time and should be in the finish.

3 TYPHOON BEN
13 start maiden who ran an improved race last time when fourth over 1690m at this track.
Expected to measure up.

5 KEEPER'S DREAM
Looked a run short when a 5.5 lengths fourth at Northam resuming last start. Further improved
and expected to do much better here.

4 RED HOT DUBAI
Well in the market last time and in the lead division around the bend before fading to miss the
frame over 1410m at this track. Jumps from a good draw and is worth including among the
chances.

R6 - BUNBURY | 16:05 | AUD $25,000 |  JCW ELECTRICAL HCP (C3)

2 DEW WEST
Been close at both her two starts in this time. Ready to improve now and has won over this
distance. Rates highly.

8 LEICA JAGUAR
Consistent gelding who has placed almost half of his career runs. Narrowly defeated when
second at Ascot over 1000m last start. Looks the one to beat.

1 OHBEEH
Gelding resumes here after an three months break. Prepared for this event with a 1000m barrier
trial at Belmont Park on 09-Nov-20. Is a >rst up winner. Will appreciate the 2kg claim for
apprentice rider.

3 BELLE OF LIBERTY
Went close to breaking through when a narrow second over 1300m at Northam last start. Looks
close to a win here.

10 NOBELIUM
Running well recently including a last start >fth by 2.5 lengths over 1000m at Ascot. Overdue and
can break through this time.

R7 - BUNBURY | 16:40 | AUD $25,000 |  TABTOUCH - BETTER YOUR BET-C1

7 SHOWADDYWADDY
Struggling to break through lately, the latest >nishing second over 2200m at Ascot. Rates highly
and expected to go close.

5 OUR D'AMOUR
Talented mare who only has one win to her name. Went well last start at her home track running
win over 2200m. Looks like an improving type and expect a bold showing.

6 RODOMONTE
Lightly raced mare progressing well. Last start posted a 2.5 lengths third over 2200m at Ascot.
Rates highly in this and expected to go close.

1 BABYTINO
No longer a maiden after a win at this track over 1690m last start, facing a rise in class this race.
Can continue form this start.

10 MORE FIZZ
Progressive and lightly raced mare. Last time recorded a 8 length sixth over 1720m at Narrogin.
Has the ability and expected to run well.

R8 - BUNBURY | 17:20 | AUD $25,000 |  AMELIA PARK (RS0LY)

2 DIABLERIE
Broke a drought when returning to winning form last start over 1100m at Albany. Con>dence
back and rates strongly again here.

3 BOLLINGER BOY
Missed the placings last time over a longer trip when seventh over 2200m at Ascot. Rates well
and should run well.

5 TONKATUFF
Broke through three back but disappointing in two runs since, the latest when 11th over 1600m
at Ascot. Hoping to find winning form again here and worth a look.

1 DUTCH SPY
Good effort when second at this track over 1008m last start. Has claims in this race if he can
reproduce that form today. Will appreciate the 2kg claim for apprentice rider. Looms as a top
chance.

8 OVERTHOUGHT
Resumes after a three months break when >nishing >fth over 1600m at Belmont Park. Sound
record fresh and should be right in the mix.


