
RACE BY RACE PREVIEWS: GREYVILLE@2025.05.10 
 
 
Greyville, 10.05.2025, Race 1, Gallops, 1000m, Turf, R125.000, 11:40GMT+2 
 
Race Summary: ARE YOU SURE has been costly to follow. She has run some decent races and should 
have won by now. It could be the right race for her. Highveld juvenile SIMBINE showed good pace in his 
last start. He is improving but has drawn widest on local debut. PINETTI caught the eye in his second 
start over 1400m after showing little on his 1000m debut. He has gate No 1 and has room for 
improvement. CHAMPAGNE PROBLEMS and LIFE ON THE TIDES have shown some potential and 
should be in the running for prize money. 
 
Selections: 
#4 Are You Sure, #9 Simbine, #1 Pinetti, #6 Champagne Problems 
 
 
Greyville, 10.05.2025, Race 2, Gallops, 1000m, Turf, R125.000, 12:15GMT+2 
 
Race Summary: The horse to catch could be PRIORY TERRACE who came in for support in a 
competitive race on debut. She was speedy and only tired late so must be given every chance in her 
second outing. But it is competitive. GORGEOUS BOMB was expected to go close in her second start 
after she finished a close second on debut. She seemed to hesitate when not running badly but may be 
wiser to the task this time. Watch out for VHAGAR who is highly regarded and showed promise on debut. 
He did not show in his next start but retains ability. CAPTAINSHIP, EMOYENI and QUEEN FENN also 
have claims. 
 
Selections: 
#1 Priory Terrace, #6 Gorgeous Bomb, #7 Vhagar, #2 Queen Fenn 
 
 
Greyville, 10.05.2025, Race 3, Gallops, 1400m, Turf, R110.000, 12:50GMT+2 
 
Race Summary: ALEX MILLER can finally open her account. She has run some fair races in the 
Western Cape and looks to be well placed on her local debut. SHESHA NTOMBI looks to be coming to 
hand at the right time. She wasn't disgraced finishing third when taking on males last time and from a 
plum gate should make a race of it. PROMISE OF FIRE wasn't far off the former and could step up on her 
form with blinkers fitted this time. Juvenile SPLASH OF LOVE is by Master Of My Fate and she could 
relish the distance after needing her debut. 
 
Selections: 
#5 Alex Miller, #2 Shesha Ntombi, #8 Splash Of Love, #4 Promise Of Fire 
 
 
Greyville, 10.05.2025, Race 4, Gallops, 1400m, Turf, R110.000, 13:23GMT+2 
 
Race Summary: The two Western Cape fillies could battle out the first leg of the exciting Pick 6. 
GREENLIGHT SKYE (drawn better) and ANOTHER DREAM have run some decent races but the latter 
could be the one with a bit more scope. She wasn't disgraced in her last start from a wide draw, both 
fillies are racing after breaks. LEMON THYME made good progress last time. She was having only her 
third outing and having run at the track must be respected. ROY'S GRACE and TAKATALVI have both 
gone close over the distance and the pair have earning potential. 
 
Selections: 
#9 Another Dream, #4 Greenlight Skye, #7 Lemon Thyme, #6 Roy's Grace 
 



Greyville, 10.05.2025, Race 5, Gallops, 1400m, Turf, R140.000, 13:58GMT+2 
 
Race Summary: Highveld filly CAPTAIN PEG has earned a solid rating and comes in as the best 
weighted runner in what is nevertheless a competitive heat. If she gets the pace she needs she could 
finally get back to winning ways. TWO G'S is the filly on the up having won her last two in a row. She is 
lightly raced and could be hard to fetch from gate No 1. But there are many who can take her on. SOHOT 
SOWHAT is a capable Western Cape filly who could enjoy the right-handed track. SONIC JET, 
KHETHIWE'S DESTINY and GO LIKE FLO are also speedy and should be in the fight. GERBERA rates 
the dark horse. 
 
Selections: 
#8 Captain Peg, #1 Two G's, #6 Sohot Sowhat, #10 Bevies Delight 
 
 
Greyville, 10.05.2025, Race 6, Gallops, 1000m, Turf, R185.000, 14:33GMT+2 
 
Race Summary: Good field for the KRA CUP. FUTURE VARIETY has run with the best around and if he 
takes to the track could show his class. THE ABDICATOR ran well in the 400m Durban Dash recently and 
jumping from stall No 1 could take advantage. LUHAMBA PHAMBILI showed good pace at 
Hollywoodbets Scottsville last time. He has run well at this course and must be taken seriously having 
also drawn well. ZIYASHA hasn't been seen since winning a high-class sprint in the Western Cape. If 
ready, he could be right there again. But the best weighted runner is WINTER GREETING who runs for a 
stable in good form. More can take it. 
 
Selections: 
#9 Future Variety, #3 Winter Greeting, #2 Luhamba Phambili, #1 The Abdicator 
 
 
Greyville, 10.05.2025, Race 7, Gallops, 1900m, Turf, R500.000, 15:15GMT+2 
 
Race Summary: Quality field for the Grade 3 World Sports Betting 1900m. Many are looking to get into 
the Hollywoodbets Durban July and this could be the race to show their worth. OKAVANGO could go well 
even though leaping in class. He is well bred and looks well weighted. His stablemates have big claims. 
NATIVE RULER must have a say after finishing 4th in the Cape Derby-as the form line is strong. Last 
year's winner, FUTURE SWING, has plenty class but is racing after a rest. UNDERWORLD goes for a hat 
trick. SHOOT THE RAPIDS and CAPE EAGLE rate big chances too. HOLDING THUMBS is one of many 
dangers. 
 
Selections: 
#8 Okavango, #1 Shoot The Rapids, #9 Native Ruler, #6 Future Swing 
 
 
Greyville, 10.05.2025, Race 8, Gallops, 1900m, Turf, R140.000, 15:55GMT+2 
 
Race Summary: REGULATION has something to come. He has shown good promise and could be a 
well-handicapped horse on local debut. VILA VICOSA produced an eye-catching finish and he too looks 
to have wins to come. A 4kg apprentice claim could make his job a bit easier. BOMBERS IN THE SKY 
was a bit disappointing in his last start when well supported. He impressed prior and must be given 
another chance. HARUN AL RASHID put it together for an easy win last time and can make more 
improvement. PAPA C and ARVERNI KING (drawn wide) are capable of taking home prize money. 
 
Selections: 
#4 Regulation, #3 Vila Vicosa, #7 Bombers In The Sky, #9 Harun Al Rashid 
 
 
 



Greyville, 10.05.2025, Race 9, Gallops, 1400m, Turf, R125.000, 16:30GMT+2 
 
Race Summary: Open Class 4 Fillies and Mares event to end. SIGN OF FATE is taking a drop in class 
and must be respected. She could also enjoy the distance. PRINCESS PALACE is holding form and 
needs to find a bit more for the win. She has drawn well and she is back to what appears to be her best 
distance. HAPPY FORTUNE has shown some decent potential. She had excuses in her last start but is 
racing after a rest this time. SIMPLE SIMPLE cast a shoe in her last start. She has run in stronger races 
and rates the dark horse. LA MADDALENA can get into the money on her form too. 
 
Selections: 
#5 Sign Of Fate, #2 Princess Palace, #4 La Maddalena, #9 Happy Fortune 
 
Best Win: #4 REGULATION                                                                                        
Best Value Bet: #9 FUTURE VARIETY                                                                                   
Best Longshot: #9 FUTURE VARIETY                                                                                   


